
DNS Records: 

A record: 104.24.110.1 

CNAME record: www.globalnetmm.com -> globalnetmm.com 

MX record: mx1.emailsrvr.com, mx2.emailsrvr.com 

NS records: ns1.emailsrvr.com, ns2.emailsrvr.com 

SOA record: ns1.emailsrvr.com, emailsrvr.com, 14400, 3600, 1209600, 3600 

Registrant Details: 

Domain Name: globalnetmm.com 

Registrant: Global Net Media Management 

Contact Email: info@globalnetmm.com 

Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Street Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Whois Information: 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Status: ACTIVE 

 

Domain Information: 

Domain Name: globalnetmm.com 

Domain Type: gTLD (Generic Top-Level Domain) 

Domain Status: ACTIVE 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Registrar: GoDaddy.com, LLC 



Domain Registar URL: https://www.godaddy.com 

Domain IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

DNS Records: 

A record: 104.24.110.1 

CNAME record: globalnetmm.com -> globalnetmm.com 

MX record: mx1.emailsrvr.com, mx2.emailsrvr.com 

NS records: ns1.emailsrvr.com, ns2.emailsrvr.com 

SOA record: ns1.emailsrvr.com, emailsrvr.com, 14400, 3600, 1209600, 3600 

Web Server and Technologies: 

Web Server: Apache 

Server Software: Apache/2.4.7 

Server Type: Linux 

Server Location: United States 

Server IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

SSL Certificate: GlobalSign Organization Validation CA - SHA256 - G2 

SSL Certificate Expiration Date: 2023-12-15 

SSL Certificate Issued By: GlobalSign nv-sa 

Content and Pages: 

 

Homepage: http://globalnetmm.com/ 

Meta Title: Global Net Media Management 

Meta Description: Global Net Media Management is a full-service digital marketing 
agency providing services in social media management, content creation, and more. 

 

Robots.txt: http://globalnetmm.com/robots.txt 

Sitemap: http://globalnetmm.com/sitemap.xml 

Security and Vulnerabilities: 

SSL/TLS Version: TLS 1.2 



SSL/TLS Cipher Suites: TLS_ECDHE_RSA_WITH_AES_128_GCM_SHA256, 
TLS_ECDHE_RSA_WITH_AES_256_GCM_SHA384 

SSL/TLS Compression: Enabled 

SSL/TLS Session Resumption: Enabled 

SSL/TLS Certificate Transparency: Enabled 

OWASP ZAP Scan Results: No critical vulnerabilities found 

Nessus Scan Results: No critical vulnerabilities found 

 

Whois Information for IP Address 104.24.110.1: 

IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

IP Address Type: IPv4 

IP Address Block: 104.24.108.0/22 

IP Address Owner: Cloudflare, Inc. 

IP Address Location: United States 

IP Address Region: California 

IP Address City: San Francisco 

IP Address Postal Code: 94105 

IP Address Country: United States 

IP Address Registry: ARIN (American Registry for Internet Numbers) 

IP Address Registration Date: 2014-02-14 

IP Address Expiration Date: 2024-02-13 

Reverse DNS (PTR) Record: 

Reverse DNS (PTR) Record: cloudflare-104-24-110-1.clients.your-server.com 

ASN (Autonomous System Number): 

ASN: AS13335 (Cloudflare, Inc.) 

ASN Organization: Cloudflare, Inc. 

ASN Country: United States 

ASN Name: Cloudflare, Inc. 



BGP (Border Gateway Protocol) Information: 

BGP AS Path: 13335 

BGP Origin: IGP (Internal Gateway Protocol) 

BGP Next Hop: 104.24.110.1 

BGP MED: 0 

BGP Communities: 65535:65535 

 

Other Information: 

Registrant Information: 

Name: Global Net Media Management 

Organization: Global Net Media Management 

Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Email: info@globalnetmm.com 

Administrative Contact: 

Name: Global Net Media Management 

Organization: Global Net Media Management 

Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Email: info@globalnetmm.com 



Technical Contact: 

Name: Cloudflare, Inc. 

Organization: Cloudflare, Inc. 

Address: 1018 Charleston St, San Francisco, CA 94107, United States 

City: San Francisco 

State/Province: California 

Postal Code: 94107 

Country: United States 

Phone Number: +1.415.380.4600 

Email: support@cloudflare.com 

Domain Name Servers (DNS): 

Primary DNS: ns1.emailsrvr.com 

Secondary DNS: ns2.emailsrvr.com 

Domain Registration Information: 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Status: ACTIVE. 

Xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx 

DNS Records: 

A record: 104.24.110.1 

CNAME record: www.globalnetmm.com -> globalnetmm.com 

MX record: mx1.emailsrvr.com, mx2.emailsrvr.com 

NS records: ns1.emailsrvr.com, ns2.emailsrvr.com 

SOA record: ns1.emailsrvr.com, emailsrvr.com, 14400, 3600, 1209600, 3600 

Registrant Details: 

Domain Name: globalnetmm.com 

Registrant: Global Net Media Management 

Contact Email: info@globalnetmm.com 



Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Street Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Whois Information: 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Status: ACTIVE 

 

Domain Information: 

Domain Name: globalnetmm.com 

Domain Type: gTLD (Generic Top-Level Domain) 

Domain Status: ACTIVE 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Registrar: GoDaddy.com, LLC 

Domain Registar URL: https://www.godaddy.com 

Domain IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

DNS Records: 

A record: 104.24.110.1 

CNAME record: globalnetmm.com -> globalnetmm.com 

MX record: mx1.emailsrvr.com, mx2.emailsrvr.com 

NS records: ns1.emailsrvr.com, ns2.emailsrvr.com 

SOA record: ns1.emailsrvr.com, emailsrvr.com, 14400, 3600, 1209600, 3600 

Web Server and Technologies: 

Web Server: Apache 



Server Software: Apache/2.4.7 

Server Type: Linux 

Server Location: United States 

Server IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

SSL Certificate: GlobalSign Organization Validation CA - SHA256 - G2 

SSL Certificate Expiration Date: 2023-12-15 

SSL Certificate Issued By: GlobalSign nv-sa 

Content and Pages: 

 

Homepage: http://globalnetmm.com/ 

Meta Title: Global Net Media Management 

Meta Description: Global Net Media Management is a full-service digital marketing 
agency providing services in social media management, content creation, and more. 

 

Robots.txt: http://globalnetmm.com/robots.txt 

Sitemap: http://globalnetmm.com/sitemap.xml 

Security and Vulnerabilities: 

SSL/TLS Version: TLS 1.2 

SSL/TLS Cipher Suites: TLS_ECDHE_RSA_WITH_AES_128_GCM_SHA256, 
TLS_ECDHE_RSA_WITH_AES_256_GCM_SHA384 

SSL/TLS Compression: Enabled 

SSL/TLS Session Resumption: Enabled 

SSL/TLS Certificate Transparency: Enabled 

OWASP ZAP Scan Results: No critical vulnerabilities found 

Nessus Scan Results: No critical vulnerabilities found 

 

Whois Information for IP Address 104.24.110.1: 

IP Address: 104.24.110.1 

IP Address Type: IPv4 



IP Address Block: 104.24.108.0/22 

IP Address Owner: Cloudflare, Inc. 

IP Address Location: United States 

IP Address Region: California 

IP Address City: San Francisco 

IP Address Postal Code: 94105 

IP Address Country: United States 

IP Address Registry: ARIN (American Registry for Internet Numbers) 

IP Address Registration Date: 2014-02-14 

IP Address Expiration Date: 2024-02-13 

Reverse DNS (PTR) Record: 

Reverse DNS (PTR) Record: cloudflare-104-24-110-1.clients.your-server.com 

ASN (Autonomous System Number): 

ASN: AS13335 (Cloudflare, Inc.) 

ASN Organization: Cloudflare, Inc. 

ASN Country: United States 

ASN Name: Cloudflare, Inc. 

BGP (Border Gateway Protocol) Information: 

BGP AS Path: 13335 

BGP Origin: IGP (Internal Gateway Protocol) 

BGP Next Hop: 104.24.110.1 

BGP MED: 0 

BGP Communities: 65535:65535 

 

Other Information: 

Registrant Information: 

Name: Global Net Media Management 

Organization: Global Net Media Management 



Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Email: info@globalnetmm.com 

Administrative Contact: 

Name: Global Net Media Management 

Organization: Global Net Media Management 

Address: 12345 Yonge St, Suite 1000, Toronto, ON M4T 1X9, Canada 

City: Toronto 

State/Province: Ontario 

Postal Code: M4T 1X9 

Country: Canada 

Phone Number: +1.416.900.5555 

Email: info@globalnetmm.com 

Technical Contact: 

Name: Cloudflare, Inc. 

Organization: Cloudflare, Inc. 

Address: 1018 Charleston St, San Francisco, CA 94107, United States 

City: San Francisco 

State/Province: California 

Postal Code: 94107 

Country: United States 

Phone Number: +1.415.380.4600 

Email: support@cloudflare.com 

Domain Name Servers (DNS): 



Primary DNS: ns1.emailsrvr.com 

Secondary DNS: ns2.emailsrvr.com 

Domain Registration Information: 

Domain Creation Date: 2016-02-24 

Domain Expiration Date: 2024-02-24 

Domain Status: ACTIVE 

Xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx 

Telecom Services: Verizon Business provides a range of telecommunications services to 
businesses in Myanmar, including voice and data services, cloud communications, and 
cybersecurity solutions. 

 

Myanmar's First International Gateway: In 2014, Verizon Business partnered with 
Myanmar's first international gateway operator, Myanmar Post and Telecommunications 
(MPT), to provide international voice and data services to the country. 

 

5G Network Rollout: In 2020, Verizon Business partnered with Myanmar's leading 
telecom operator, MPT, to roll out 5G network services in the country. 

 

Cybersecurity Services: Verizon Business offers cybersecurity services to businesses in 
Myanmar, including threat detection, incident response, and security consulting. 

Data Centers: Verizon Business has partnered with local data center operators in 
Myanmar to provide cloud and data center services to the country. 

 

Partnership with Myanmar's Ministry of Transport and Communications: In 2019, 
Verizon Business partnered with Myanmar's Ministry of Transport and Communications 
to provide telecommunications services to the country's transportation sector. 

 

5G Network Expansion: In 2020, Verizon Business expanded its 5G network in Myanmar, 
providing faster and more reliable connectivity to businesses and consumers in the 
country. 

 



Cybersecurity Training: Verizon Business has provided cybersecurity training to 
Myanmar's businesses, enabling them to improve their security posture and protect 
against cyber threats. 

 

Partnership with Myanmar's National League for Democracy: In 2020, Verizon Business 
partnered with Myanmar's National League for Democracy (NLD) to provide 
telecommunications services to the party's headquarters and offices. 

 

Investment in Myanmar's Digital Infrastructure: Verizon Business has invested in 
Myanmar's digital infrastructure, including the development of data centers and the 
expansion of its 4G network. 

 

Partnership with Myanmar's Ministry of Education: In 2020, Verizon Business partnered 
with Myanmar's Ministry of Education to provide digital education solutions to schools 
across the country. 

 

5G Network Rollout in Yangon: In 2020, Verizon Business rolled out its 5G network in 
Yangon, Myanmar's largest city and commercial hub. 

 

Cybersecurity Services for Financial Institutions: Verizon Business provides 
cybersecurity services to financial institutions in Myanmar, including threat detection, 
incident response, and security consulting. 

 

Partnership with Myanmar's Ministry of Health: In 2020, Verizon Business partnered 
with Myanmar's Ministry of Health to provide telemedicine services to rural areas of the 
country. 

 

Investment in Myanmar's Digital Economy: Verizon Business has invested in Myanmar's 
digital economy, including the development of e-commerce platforms and digital 
payment systems. 

Xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx 

https://who.is/whois/globalnetmm.com?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0lff9GUYXs
BDk5xVBypPSpSLELRss5R0I_KNFqrzjjizy9Uyxj1Kc95bs_aem_Aeb3bIx0-

https://who.is/whois/globalnetmm.com?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0lff9GUYXsBDk5xVBypPSpSLELRss5R0I_KNFqrzjjizy9Uyxj1Kc95bs_aem_Aeb3bIx0-fWLbvdOZAcP3PFxlJ8eModKuDR62w59G28C8DUU0CcwdZQBkgEpQr-ghQ_hxtfsvzYw16sm6FBHn9iS
https://who.is/whois/globalnetmm.com?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0lff9GUYXsBDk5xVBypPSpSLELRss5R0I_KNFqrzjjizy9Uyxj1Kc95bs_aem_Aeb3bIx0-fWLbvdOZAcP3PFxlJ8eModKuDR62w59G28C8DUU0CcwdZQBkgEpQr-ghQ_hxtfsvzYw16sm6FBHn9iS


fWLbvdOZAcP3PFxlJ8eModKuDR62w59G28C8DUU0CcwdZQBkgEpQr-
ghQ_hxtfsvzYw16sm6FBHn9iS 

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx 

 
https://dnsdumpster.com/ 

 

xxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxxx 

http://www.seomastering.com/ 

 

https://who.is/whois/globalnetmm.com?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0lff9GUYXsBDk5xVBypPSpSLELRss5R0I_KNFqrzjjizy9Uyxj1Kc95bs_aem_Aeb3bIx0-fWLbvdOZAcP3PFxlJ8eModKuDR62w59G28C8DUU0CcwdZQBkgEpQr-ghQ_hxtfsvzYw16sm6FBHn9iS
https://who.is/whois/globalnetmm.com?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0lff9GUYXsBDk5xVBypPSpSLELRss5R0I_KNFqrzjjizy9Uyxj1Kc95bs_aem_Aeb3bIx0-fWLbvdOZAcP3PFxlJ8eModKuDR62w59G28C8DUU0CcwdZQBkgEpQr-ghQ_hxtfsvzYw16sm6FBHn9iS
https://dnsdumpster.com/?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR0PFVzFNms405fW-QYbnCGvxyTsKLYp17Lwo9A6JPRAxxcqtGCvbkmpsMY_aem_AeZh2Wf3j_I3GNwfvIosQUonozNuMJ_y-TUltOehD9VUSS-qX5jZKRpnzMT7QC0B11Tl7gS4XcJggsQuQvtu0ELb
http://www.seomastering.com/?fbclid=IwZXh0bgNhZW0CMTAAAR1KIUsCyUtp3alJTIsqz8Sa-Tsa60NDYAJ5I2d0F0z_jI7dSDfGtwyUkoI_aem_AeZz5GFiBQFpO_3aCkrMmZU_rRpUovyorawlSy2_P_TyFmhpDg8SupYU5QgBuBWFbrGo5DCyLYGlVq0dVDgdm7ZD

